Campbell County Public Library
Proposal for Copier/Scanner/Printer/Fax Services for Public

Bidder's Sheet - 15 Mar 2023 (Page 1)

Total Cost of

Total Cost of Delivery/Install Total Cost of

All of All Total Cost of Delivery of

Copy/Scan/F Copy/Scan/Fax All Vend All Vend

Bidder Name ax Equipment Equipment Equipment Equipment
Donnellon McCarthy Enterprises/Sharp $30,641.00 $0.00 $35,170.00 $0.00
Donnellon McCarthy Enterprises/Savin $45,179.00 $0.00 $35,170.00 $0.00
Prosource $29,428.00 $0.00 $30,690.00 $0.00
Toshiba Business Solutions $40,504.41 $0.00 $95,000.00 $0.00

Woodhull $27,649.80 $0.00  $31,815.00 $0.00




Campbell County Public Library

Proposal for Copier/Scanner/Printer/Fax Services for Public

Bidder's Sheet - 15 Mar 2023 (Page 2)

Total Monthly Total Annual

Per Hour Cost Cost of Cost of Per Hour Cost for Total Monthly Total Annual Cost
for Incidental Regular Regular Incidental Service Cost of Regular of Regular
Service of All Maintenance Maintenance of All Maintenance All Maintenance All
Copier All Copier All Copier Copy/Fax/Scan Copy/Fax/Scan Copy/Scan/Print
Equipment Equipment Equipment Equipment Equipment Equipment
$0.00 $271.95 $3,263.40 $0.00 $572.24 $6,866.88
$0.00 $271.95 $3,263.40 $0.00 $572.24 $6,866.88
$0.00 $44.94 $539.28 $0.00 $8.85 $106.20
$170.00 $77.70 $932.40 $170.00 $120.76 $1,449.12
Included in copier |Included in copier |Included in copier
$0.00 $207.00 $2,484.00 service service service




Campbell County Public Library
Proposal for Copier/Scanner/Printer/Fax Services for Public

Bidder's Sheet - 15 Mar 2023 (Page 3)

Per Hour Cost Total Monthly Total Annual

for Incidental Cost of Regular Cost of Regular Total Monthly Total Annual

Total Monthly

Service of All Maintenance Maintenance Cost of Cost of Cost of
Print All Print All Print Maintenance Maintenance Collection of All

Equipment Equipment Equipment All Equipment All Equipment Vends
$0.00 $38.85 $466.20 $883.04 $10,596.48 $1,560.00
$0.00 $38.85 $466.20 $883.04 $10,596.48 $1,560.00
$0.00 $67.41 $808.92 $121.20 $1,454.40 $400.00

$170.00 $90.57 $1,086.84 $289.03 $3,468.36 No bid

Included in

copier service $172.73 $2,072.76 $379.79 $4,556.76 $250.00




Campbell County Public Library
Proposal for Copier/Scanner/Printer/Fax Services for Public

Bidder's Sheet - 15 Mar 2023 (Page 4)

Total Per
Hour/Incident
Cost of Total Monthly
Total Annual Incidental Cost of Regular
Cost of Service of All Maintenance of Price for
Collection of All Vend All Vend Copy/Print
Vends Equipment Equipment Paper Price for Toner
Included in
$18,720.00 $0.00 $0.00 No bid maintenance
Included in
$18,720.00 $0.00 $0.00 No bid maintenance
$4,800.00 $150.00 $0.00|See price sheet |See price sheet
Included in
No bid $0.00 $0.00 No bid maintenance
Included in service | Included in service Included in
$3,000.00 agreement agreement No bid maintenance




